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      *******************************************************************

BIDDER
NO. 1 Vinton Construction Company
NO. 2 Staab Construction Corporation
NO. 3 Advance Construction

BIDDER
ITEM BID UNIT UNIT UNIT
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNITS QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

ARCHER STREET LIFT STATION

1.
Furnish & Install 24" PVC Pipe (SDR-35), 
Sanitary LF 140 $368.00 $51,520.00 $342.00 $47,880.00 $359.00 $50,260.00

2.
Furnish & Install Standard Manhole, Type 
1, Sanitary VF 37 $266.00 $9,842.00 $255.00 $9,435.00 $2,000.00 $74,000.00

3.
Furnish & Install 18" poluethylene SDR-11 
Class 160 (Open Cut) LF 370 $544.00 $201,280.00 $376.00 $139,120.00 $810.00 $299,700.00

4.
Furnish & Install 18" poluethylene SDR-11 
Class 160 (Directionally Bored) LF 200 $377.00 $75,400.00 $376.00 $75,200.00 $810.00 $162,000.00

5. Furnish & Install 16" DI Forcemain LF 53 $353.20 $18,719.60 $328.00 $17,384.00 $190.00 $10,070.00

6. Furnish & Install 16" PVC (C-905) Forcemain LF 82 $192.00 $15,744.00 $275.00 $22,550.00 $60.00 $4,920.00

7. Furnish & Install 12" Tapping TEE EA 1 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

8. Furnish & Install 6" PVC Water Service LF 95 $66.00 $6,270.00 $57.00 $5,415.00 $100.00 $9,500.00

9. Furnish & Install Fire Hydrant EA 1 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $2,375.00 $2,375.00 $8,300.00 $8,300.00

10. Furnish & Install 2" HDPE Water Service LF 5 $122.00 $610.00 $130.00 $650.00 $100.00 $500.00

11. Furnish & Install 2" Water Corporation EA 1 $750.00 $750.00 $750.00 $750.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

12.
Furnish & Install 12" PVC (SDR-35) Storm 
Sewer Pipe LF 28 $47.00 $1,316.00 $54.00 $1,512.00 $75.00 $2,100.00

13. Furnish & Install Type B Inlet EA 1 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00

14.
Furnish & Install Standard Manhole, Type 
1, Storm VF 7 $309.00 $2,163.00 $220.00 $1,540.00 $330.00 $2,310.00

15. 8-inch Crushed Aggregate Base Course SY 550 $4.00 $2,200.00 $5.40 $2,970.00 $10.00 $5,500.00
16. 7-inch Concrete Pavement SY 550 $37.00 $20,350.00 $40.00 $22,000.00 $50.00 $27,500.00

17. Remove and Replace Guard Rail LS 1 $750.00 $750.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

18. Demolition of Existing Lift Station LS 1 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

19. Construction of New Lift Station LS 1 $1,731,400.00 $1,731,400.00 $1,973,269.00 $1,973,269.00 $1,651,798.00 $1,651,798.00

20. Section 01020 Allowances LS 1 $131,000.00 $131,000.00 $131,000.00 $131,000.00 $131,000.00 $131,000.00

$2,304,764.60 $2,484,000.00 $2,564,758.00

1a. 16-Inch PVC Forcemain (C-905) Open Cut LF 370 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $800.00 $296,000.00

2a.
16-Inch PVC Forcemain (C-905) 
Directionally Bored LF 200 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $800.00 $160,000.00

TOTAL

ALTERNATE BID ITEMS

Staab Construction Corporation

A R C H E R  S T R E E T  L I F T  S T A T I O N

Advance ConstructionVinton Construction Company

$2,304,764.60
$2,484,000.00

" B I D   T A B U L A T I O N S "
F O R 

CITY OF MANITOWOC   CONTRACT NO. WU-08-10
BIDS RECEIVED:  APRIL 30, 2008

$2,564,758.00


